
NEWAYGO HIGH SCHOOL 
March 20, 2025 
 
STUDENT COUNCIL AND NATIONAL HONOR SOCIETY MEMBERS  
All Student Council and National Honor Society members are to report to Mrs. Lathrop’s 
room for a meeting today during Advisory. 

 
SENIORS  
Your senior trip money is due to Mrs. Grugett no later than Thursday, March 27th. Cash 
or check made payable to Newaygo High School. IF you have any questions please see 
Mrs. Grugett. 

 
APRIL SATURDAY SCHOOL  
On April 12th and April 19th there will be Saturday school offered. If you have time to 
make up this will be a great opportunity to do so. With prom fast approaching please 
remember for those of you who have time to make up, you will need to have 10 or less 
hours. 

 
NDEN WINNERS  
Congratulations to Lydia Graham and Floyd Ryman! They are our Shamrock Shake 
winners this week! Please come to the office Friday during lunch to claim your prize! 

 
Students  
Employers are starting to hire for summer jobs. Make sure to check out the "Jobs 
Board" in the main hallway and the new "Newaygo High School College and Career 
Hub" on Facebook and Instagram. New jobs will be posted as we hear from potential 
employers. Our newest posting is from GB Lawn Care. If you're 17 years old, check it 
out! You might be interested! 

 
SENIORS:  
A reminder that your graduation announcements & accessories will be delivered at 
school during lunch on Friday, March 21st. If you owe a balance, please make sure that 
it is paid in full prior to delivery. To pay off your balance you may do so online or by 
calling Jostens at 616-330-2141. If you plan to make final payment on delivery day at 
school, only cash (correct change please) or money orders can be accepted. Checks 
cannot be accepted for final payment at school. If you still have not placed an order for 
your graduation items, you need to do so as soon as possible at www.jostens.com. This 
delivery does NOT include your cap and gown items. Those will be delivered a later 
date this spring. 

 
MENU 

MONDAY - IRISH SPUD SPREAD, PROTEIN CHOICE, PEARS 

TUESDAY- CRISPITOS, REFRIED BEANS, PEACHES 

WEDNESDAY - CHICKEN TENDERS, ROMAIN RIBBONS, APPLES 

THURSDAY - CHEESEBURGER SLIDERS, SWEET POTATO FRIES, MANDARIN 

http://www.jostens.com/


ORANGES 

 

FRIDAY- QUESADILLA, CALIFORNIA BLEND, MIXED FRUIT 


